POMONA VALLEY CO-OP PURCHASING GROUP - PAPER SUPPLY BID 18-19 USAGES

VENDOR: MINIMUMS:
b 5 . n Sbrod ode USAGE
TOTAL | Bid Price Order Codes / Notes

1 Alcohol Prep Pads 10/100/cs DWF2449PKT 125 $ 17.05 | DMW-F2449PKT

2 Apron, Poly Foodhandler - 28"X46" HEAVY 10/50/CS 250-FH3L 40 s 25.45 |GOL-1534  5/100/CS

3 Apron, Bib-Disposable "Bettermade” 10/100/CS Goldmax 1531 330 $ 23.30 |GOL-1531 20/50/CS

4 Bag, Eeco Grab i G0 Handle 11x10x3.5 500/CS  [Command Pkg COM-FIIGP| 95 | yocc|comriicp

5 Bag, Foil Cheeseburger Printed 1M/CS Papercon 300529 252 $ 27.85 |PPC-300529

6 Bag, Foil Chicken, Printed 1M/CS Papercon 444492 455 s 27.85 |PPC-444492

7 Bag, PRINTED FOIL BURRITO 1M/CS BRN-5A00 50 §  =nem | EEse

8 Bag, 6x2x8 "DELICIOUS" FOIL 1m/CS BRN-5A20 108 [P

9 Bag, Foil, Grease Resistant 1000/cs ZEN-A-4F 500 $ 34.90 | ZEN-A-4F

10 Bag, Foil Hamburger, Plain 1M/CS Papercon 300533 788 s o765 | rresmms

11 Bag, Foil Hamburger, Printed 1M/CS Papercon 300527 26 $ 27.85 |PPC-300527

12 Bag, Foil Hot Dog, Plain 1M/CS Papercon 300456 389 s 27.85 |PPC-300456

13 Bag, Paper Lunch "LOVE" 1m/CSs Bagcraft #200 31 $ 47.15 |BAG-200

14 Bag, Paper Lunch # 6 Brown 500/CS AIM-6LB 701

15 Bag, Sandwich #16 2000/CS 16SB 10 $ 17.80 |cLB-165B

16 Bag, Paper Sleevgl-::\lte& Delicious Pizza SMICS Bag-300417 195 s 2780 | BAG 300817

17 Bag, Utility 18x24 WI/TIES250/C 250/cs ELK-BOR1824H 231 g 265 | meEereren
18 Bowl, Pulp Round, 16 oz. 500/cs SABERT 46016D500 350 s 5 | erm ammanEEs

19 Lid, Clear, Flat for 16 oz Bow| Above 500/cs SABERT 51616D500 90 s 5755 | SresEensm

20 Booties, Aqua Track Universal 75 PRI/CS US Safety AT31111 50 s v |uss amaramns
21 Pizza Saver Lid Support - Plastic White 1000/cs Goldmax 20431 52 s a0 lee s

22 Box, Corrugated 18"x12"x12" 25/BDL Tharco #R2070 70 OAK-0011812121 20/BDL
23 Box, Pizza 16"x1"x5/8", Pizza print on top 50/cs Whalen 16KW 1275

24 Box, #1 Kraft/Earth Bio 450/CS SCTRAY SC-0731 60

25 Box, snack, 7x 4 x 4 500/CS SOU-27186 150 $ 61.50 | DOP-D7SNKBW

26 Box, Triangle Pizza White 400/CS DOP D168CLMW 417 s 49.05 | DOP-D168CLMW
27 Broom, Hotel Style - plastic EA OCEDAR 6410 40 $ 3.85 |ACS-B410A

28 Bulbs, Heat EA 250BR401 5 $13.95 | HAL-104044

29 Bun Rack Covers 52x 80 S0/RL FOOD R ANDLER 298 | 1100 |ELKBORS280

30 Container, Chinese "Box" 160z Dragon 9/50/CS G?éﬁ\fv’\égvfgr 1156 $ 24.00 | GWP-16FP-DMW
31 Container Chinese "Box" 160z Pagoda 9/50/CS GOLDEN WEST 16MW 280 $ 24.00 | GWP-16FP-PMW
32 Container, Clamshell Hamburger, 5" 500/CS DOP -DGRGRCLA 132

33 Container, Clamshell 1 comp. 8x8x2 200/Cs PACTIV YC181120 136 $ 23.10 |PCA-YCI8-1120

34 Container, Clamshell 3 comp. 8x8x2 200/CS PACTIV YC181123 30 s 23.10 |PCA-YCI8-1123

35 Container, 3 Comp. Styro Hinged 200/Cs DART 85HT3 155 $ 15.95 | GPK-SN243VW.

36 Container, Clear 12 oz. Deli 500/CS FAB-PK12S-C 170 s 21.95 |FAB-PK12S-C

37 Container, Clear 5" Hinged Smartlock 375/CS PACTIV YC181050 140 $ 25.95 |PCA-YCI8-1050

38 Container, Clear 9" 1 Comp. Hinged 250/CS DRT-C89PST1 295 s 38.35 | DRT-C89PSTL

39 conainer DOPZ‘;‘:“L?JI:E;M clamshell 500/cs POP-DBRGRCLAM 10 $ 71.45 |DOP-DBRGRCLAM
40 Container Food, 4 0z. White 1m/CS LLC-KDP 4W 300 s 33.40 |EES-YGTC04W-D75
41 Container Food, 6 0z. White 1m/Cs LLC-KDP 6W 125 $ 33.90 |EES-YGTCO6W-D96
42 Container Food, 8 0z. White 1m/CS LLC-KDP 8W 350 s 34.40 |EES-YGTCO8W-D95
43 Cont. Plastic Hinged, Lunch Box 500/CS Par Pak 02010 115 s .55 [Pemarme

44 Cont. Small Hot Dog 250/CS Park Pak 02452 75 $ 26.20 | PAR-02452

25 Container, Hingse&:lidge Sandwich - 500/cs PAR-21507 6 . 2775 |PAR21507
45.5 Wedge, Sandwich Hinged 1000/cs PARPAK 21508 175 $ 30.10 |PAR-21508 500/CS
46 Container, Hot & Cold ~ 3-comp 8x8x2 250/cs PARPAK 29371 50 $ 33.25 |PAR-29371
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47 Container, 1-comp, Med 7x7x3 250/cs PARPAK 21358 25 $ 42.75 | PAR-21358
48 Container, 2-comp /dipping pocket Tray 500/cs PARPAK 82612 25 $ 41.30 | PAR-82612
49 Container, 4x4x1 5/8 Cold Only 500/cs PARPAK 21117 15 $ 41.00 |PAR-21117
50 Container, 5x5x2 7/8, Cold Only 500/cs PARPAK 29367 5 $ 35.15 | PAR-29367
51 Container, Hoagie, 8" 250/cs PARPAK 29250 200 $ 25.15 | PAR-29250
52 Container, 100z Hinged Hot & Cold 1350/cs PARPAK 21750 10 $ 66.10 | PAR-21750
53 Container, Hinged 8" x 8" x 3" 250/cs DART-C90PST1 100 $ 23.10 |PCA-YCIB-1120 200/CS
54 Container, 4 oz Translucent 2500/cs DLK-HP400 50 $ 25.95 | DLK-HP400
55 Lid, Container, 40z Translucent 2500/cs DLK-HPLID345 50 $ 21.60 | DLK-HPLID345
56 Container, 3-Comp 8x6x2 300/cs PARPAK 82723 10 $ 43.05 | PAR-82723
57 Container, 4-cmpt Box 300/cs FAB-GS6-4 5 $ 38.15 | FAB-GS6-4
58 Container Lid for 4-cmpt Box 300/Cs FAB-LGS-6 0 $ 24.40 |FAB-LGS6
59 Container, 6X5 Hinged 300/cs PARPAK 02345 25 $ 45.95 | PAR-02345
60 Container, Flat lid for above 6 0z cont. im LLC-KDL96PP 125 $ 22.70 |LLC-KDL96PP
61 Container 2 comp. nacho black 500/cs par Pak 29191 150 $ 36.40 | PAR-29191
62 Container, Lid for above nacho cont. 250/cs Par Pak 21504 300 $ 26.90 | PAR-21504
64 8X8 Black Bottom/Clear Top 200/cs DPI-COX-88-BB-BK 200 s s [erreswnEne
65 Container, Clear GoCubes Base 300/Cs PLA-CC1-32-CLR 60 $ 42.45 |PLA-CC1-32-CLR
66 Container, Clear GoCubes Lid 300/Cs PLA-CC1-L1-300 60 $ 24.15 |PLA-CC1-L1-300
67 Container, FoldPak Bio-Plus View Food 160/cs 3BPVIEWW 60 $ 44.45 | GSD-3BPVIEWW.
68 Container, Plastic Hinged Hoagie 8" 250/CS SPKCHCB843 198 $ 25.15 |PAR-29250
69 Container, Plastic Hinged Hoagie 9" 250/CS PCA-YCI81049 335 $ 31.35 |PCA-YCI8-1049
70 Container, Plastic Hinged Med Square 200/Cs PCA-YCI81120 -Smart-lock 195 $ 23.10 |PCA-YCI8-1120
71 Container, Octaview, shallow 100/cs SOL-865624 180 $53.95 | GPK-PV240  150/CS
72 Container, Food 320z w/Lid 250/Cs KH32A-2050 20 SOL-KHB32A-W
73 Container, 320z Clear, Hinged Flat Lid 200/CS GPK-AD32 30
75 Cleaner - Ammonia 4/1 gal GRN-250941 2
76 Cleaner, Dish Soap, Liquid 4/1 GAL Palmolive 04910 506
7 Cleaner - Liquid Comet 9/320z/cs PGC-53835 2 m
78 Cleaner, Glass 4 - 1gallons GEN-3305R 2
79 Cleaner, Laundry Detergent HE, Soap 4/1 gal LUSEAUX 195 39 26.95 |LUS-410
80 Cleaner, Hand Soap Liquid Refil - Pink 4 - 1gallons GEN-1552PR 20 12.00 |GEN-1552PR
81 Cleaner, Lava Bar, Soap 48/CS WDC-10383 60
82 Cleaner, Stainless Steel Wipes Canister Blue Egl)igzn_riigl:an & 100
83 Cleaner, Bleach 3/1210z CLOROX 309066 574
84 Cleaner, Degreaser 4/1 GAL CHEMCOR - 80201 61
85 Cleaner, Delimer "Lime Up" 4/1 GAL GENLAB 2068 22
86 Cleaner, Oven Fumeless 6/240z EZ Off 62338 55 s 0 | EEesmm
87 Cleaner, Stainless Steel 12/16 OZ CMC 844 59 CMC-CS234  12/140Z
88 Spray, Sanitizing, Hard Surface 12/320z C10-01698 75
89 Cup, Hot Mug w/Handle, Clear Plastic 240/case EDR-DCM7C 5
$ 34.05 |EDR-DCM7C
90 Cup, 2.50z "Munchie" 1m/Cs Solo #GF24 410 SOL-GF24
91 Cups, Drinking 50z plastic 2500/cs FAB-01353 25
92 Cup, 7 oz. Paper DP Champagne 2500/CS LETICIA 7PCMPB 180
93 Parfait insert 1000/cs PTINS-D98 60 $ 21.40 |VIG-VPTC-ISTO8
94 Cup, plastic, 9 oz. 20/50 cs SOL-TP9R 60 EES-PTC09-D92
95 Cup Lid 4oz Flat F/C 1M/CS LLC-KDL76PP 300
96 Cup, 80z 'Hearty Soup' Combo 250/CS SOLO KHB8A-HS 55
97 Cup, 90z Paper Cold 2500/CS LETICIA 9PCMPB 115
98 Cup,160z Paper Cold 1200/CS LETICIA 16PCMPB 40
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99

Cup, 16 oz. Clear PET

1000/Cs

KOD-PTC16-D98

90

$ 35.35 |EES-PTC16
100 Dish Glove, H/D Orange - Large 12/Cs IMP-8430L 10 $ 19.90 |IMP-8430L
101 Dish Glove, H/D Orange - Medium 12/cs IMP-8430M 15 $ 19.90 |IMP-8430M
102 Envelope, packing slip 1000 THO-ADM51 15 $ 24.95 | THO-ADMS51
103 Film, Cold Seal, CX 100G 20"/5,500 ft- | 5-2000-100-200 PLATINUM 125 _
aporox 40# PKG
104 Foil, 18 x 1000 Heavy Duty ROLL HFA 11807 629 $ 24.35 |HFA-11803
105 Foil, 24 x 1000 Heavy Duty ROLL HFA 12408 105 $ 53.25 |HFA-12408
106 Foil, Wrap 9 x 10.75 6/500/CS HFA-8950 535 $ 33.35 |HFA-JIF-8950
107 Hand Sanitizer color free 12/400ML Debs 56815 180 $ 78.85 | DEB-56815
108 Ice Blanket, 16.5" x 8 3/4" 48/CS CRY-970330 82 $  118.80 |CRY-85033 16.5'%34' ROLL
109 Ice Mat, 16.5" x 8 3/4" 48/CS CRY-85036 2
$ 118.80 |CRY-85036
110 Pail, Sanitizing 8qt EA Kleen Pail RED B s 65 |in cans e e
111 Pallet Wrap, 65 Gauge 4/CS Nutribon HW1880 36 _
112 Pan, 4" Full Steam 50/CS HFA-2019-0 100 $ 32.60 |HFA-2019-00
113 Paper, Sq, Wax, 12" x 12" White 5/1000/CS PAPERCUTTERS 182117 119 $ 35.95 |PAT-220220-1212
114 Pick Up Tissue, 6" x 10.75" 10/1M CS PAPERCON TF6 72 $ 33.45 |NRP-FWW6
115 Plastic Bottle, 22 oz EA Continental #922B 122 $ 0.53 |TOL-120119
116 Plastic Trigger, Togofﬁgayer(must fit 22 oz. EA Continental 902BW7 32 s 053 IoL110501
117 Sabert, Dome Lid, for 24 to 48 oz Bow! 100/case SAB 52048A 4 s 5 e mmmass
118 Sabert® Bowl, FresBr::cakck® 48 oz. Classic, 100/case SAB-92048A 4 s 30.30 | SAB-62048A100
119 Sanitizer, Maxi-E Quat (or equivalent) 4/1 GAL GENLABS 1108 90 _
o SCh?VS;;ggzgr};itsyt’r:v?\' " mics Nutribon #SH3 1 17225 g 9.55 |Daxwell B10001522
121 |SchootbunchKit fed Wi (wiPuncture| g Nutribon #3608P 15018 |g  oss |Daxwell 310003061
122 Scrubber, Green, H Duty, Thick 6/10/BOX ACS 2096 385 $ 9.90 | ACS-S096
123 Scrubber, S/Steel Sponge 12/PK ACS 434PB 82 $ 3.85 | ACS-434PB
124 Scrubber, Sponge 20/BOX ACS-74-612 88 $ 10.35 | ACS-74-615
125 SOS Pads, Soap Pads (Hotel Size) 10/15/CS Brillo SOS 88320 161 $ 26.95 |CLO-88320 12/15/CS
126 Sterno, NO WICK , Canned Heat 72/70z Candlelamp 20108 2
127 Stirrers, Plastic 5.5" 1000/BX GOLDMAX 37511 12
128 Straws, 7.75" Plastic Wrapped 24/500/CS DIAMOND 204WS 17
129 Straw, giant, red 2500/cs GOL-39051 10 $ 7.95 | GOL-39051
130 Tablecloth, Paper, White 54" X 108" 25/CS Hoffmaster 210130 142 $ 32.95 |HOF-210130
181 TablecmhA:slzsr:i:& \gglict)?sM" o 25/Cs Hoffmaster 112000 37 $ 2320 |HOF-112000 _12/CS
132 Tape, Various Colors 10/Roll/Pkg. SHURTAPE - PP808 13 g T
133 Tissue, Bathroom 2 ply 48/Cs Papse;iggme 60 | p—
134 Toilet Seat Cover 10/250 Goldmax HS4250 27 _
135 Towel, Disposable 150/cs CHX-0071 300 g 38.80 |cHx0071
136 Towels, Disposable Cloth 13 1/2" x 24" 150/CS Kimberly Clark 06280 1422 s 555 |lemmesnamm
137 Towels, Paper Unbleached Multifold 200/PK Goldmax 21021 65 $ 12.80 | TET-MET162501K 16/250/CS
138 Towels, Paper White, Single Fold 16 /250 Papersource ST195 10 _
139 Tray, Nested Fresh Express 500/CS LA Paperbox 13381FEC 6925 $ 27.00 |LAP-13381FEC
¥y Tray';fg\gfﬁ ata)\l/rgétvgxhciet:d soas 500/Cs PACTIV - W1002 SWH 38292 |5 1620 |a/n25ct, SysCls, SUPCH 4295360
141 Trays, 5-Comp, Black Heavy Duty 500/cs MBL-YTHBO500GBX 8500
142 Tray, Cardboard, 9"x12"x1" 250/CS CHI-TURRET 40
143 Tray, foodboat 1/4# 4/250 CHI-FT025 200 $ 10.95 |CHI-FT025
144 Tray, foodboat 1# 4/250 CHI-FT100 300 $ 12.65 | CHI-FT100
145 Tray Hinged, 8oz, H/C 1350/cs PARPAK-21748 25 $ 68.95 | PAR-21748
146 Tray Hinged, 60z, H/C 1500/cs PARPAK-21961 25 $ 75.80 | PAR-21961
147 Tray, Styro Poly 2/250/CS #CKF-4SW 570 $ 17.15 |CKF-asW
148 Tray, Red Plaid Carry 500/CS DIXIE CT963R 12819 $ 15.30 | CHI-R963CT
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149 Tray, Snap Up 8 5/8" 500/CS LA BOX SU858-17 6898
LAP-SU858-17
Tray , 2 cell hamburger Style clear,
150 8.85"x6.425"x2.05" sealable 750/cs #3345 PLASTIC PKG 600
151 Tray , 2 cell clear, , 8.375"x6.5"x2.5" food 600/CS #3345 PLASTIC PKG 600
arade 0-175f seable
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
152 Wrap, Foil Chicken 10 1/2" x 14" 4/500/CS Papercon 300855 132 45.50 | PPC-300855
153 Wrap, Foil Blue Checkered 4/500CS Papercon 300844 333 45.50 | PPC-300844
154 Wrap, Foil Green Checkered 4/500CS Papercon 300845 318
45.50 |PPC-300845
155 Wrap, Foil Red Checkered 4/500CS Papercon 300842 209
45.50 |PPC-300842
156 Wrap, Foil Mexi Chili Pepper 5/500CS Papercon 400028 4 69.95 | PPC-400028
157 Wrap, Red Check, 12 X 12 5/1000 pk Patterson 2202121 115
51.40 |PAT-2202121-3041
158 Wraps, Yellow 12 x 12 Grease Resistant 5M/CS Papercutters 180754 21 44.00 | PCT-180754
159 Wrap, Taco Xpress 1200/cs PPC-1212TACO 10
83.00 |PPC-1212TACO  2500/CS
160 Wrap, Cushion Foil Sandwich 4/500 PPC-300815 20
45.50 |PPC-300815
161 Wrap, Cheesebuger Cushion Foil 4/500 PPC-300853 10 45,50 |PPC-300853
Lot Total 1172
The following items #will be awarded as a
lot
162 BAG COLD NONVENT 6X8.75 5000/CS CD-68NV 15
NO QUOTE
163 BAG HOT 5X9 5000/CS HB59V 20 NO QUOTE
164 SEALING TAPE 1402 GREEN 38X18Yds EACH 1402G 30 NO QUOTE
165 OBLONG 3 COMPARTMENT TRAY W/LID 250/CS 2045-35-250W 5
46.50 |HFA-2045-35-250W
Lot Total 70
The following items #will be awarded as a
lot
166 Bags, Plain Wax # 3 2000/CS Cal Bag 3SB 10 7.15 | ZEN-6522
167 Bags, Plain Wax # 6 2000/CS Cal Bag 6SB 143
9.50 |CLB-6SB
168 Bags, Plain Wax #12 2000/CS Cal Bag 12SB 55
11.25 |ZEN-6530
169 Bags, Plain Wax #19 2000/CS Cal Bag 19SB 123 14.85 |ZEN-6534
Lot Total 331
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
170 Bags Plain 5 x 5 2000/CS ELKAY DP5555 75 6.10 |ELK-DP5555
171 Bags, Plastic Bun Bag 27 x 37 200/Cs ELKAY BOR2737HD 1001 12.10 | ELK-BOR2737HD
172 Bags, Plastic Deli/Pretzel, Zip Lock 1M/CS ELKAY DP9758 15 20.95 | ELK-DP9758
173 Bag, Plain Saddle Pack 6.5" X 6.25" 2000/CS ELKAY DP6562 1997 6.80 | ELK-DP6562
Bags, Plastic, FRESH EXPRESSED 6.5" x
174 6.05" 2M/CS FOOD HANDLER 6709FEC 50 13.95 |FDH-6709FEC
175 Bag, Ice 12x21 Printed 1000/cs ELKAY H21PMET 23 51.95 | ELK-H21PMET
176 Bag, Freezer 10x14 1000/CS FDH-22FS10 210 12.60 |FDH-22-FS10
ELKAY-BOR-1524HD or
177 Bag, Freezer 18 x 24 250/Cs EOQUAL 797 8.95 | ELK-BOR1824HD
178 Bag, Freezer 18 x 30 200/Cs FDH-22FS1830 315 795 | ELK-BOR1830HD
Lot Total 4483
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The following items # will be awarded as a

lot
Bags, Hot Fill, 10x24, 4.5 Mil., -20/200+, no

B-BB1-1024C

180 clio S FLAVORSEAL 5 | Nosid No Bid
Bags, Hot Fill, 10x30, 4.5 Mil., -20/200+, no B-BB1-1030C
181 U g y U ' : :
clip s FLAVORSEAL 80 No Bid No Bid
182 Bag Clips for Hot Fill Bags 1000/cs G-CL4100h 5 No Bid No Bid
Lot Total 140
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
183 Bags, Ziploc, 2 Gal. 100/CS ELKAY 2GALFR 472 $ 12.60 |ELK-2GALFR
184 Bags Ziploc 1 Gal 250/Cs ELKAY F210216 212 $ 10.50 | GLE-DZR-5117
Lot Total 684
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot-LIDS MUST FIT BOWL IN THIS LOT
185 Bowl, 5" Round, Black 5 oz Plastic 500/CS ANCHOR 4604802 65
$ 33.00 |ANC-4604802
Lid, 5" Round, 5 oz Plastic Clear
186 (Lid Must Fit Bowl Above) 500/CS ANCHOR LH4800D 65 3 e —"
187 Bowl, 5" Round, Black 8 oz Plastic 500/CS ANCHOR 4604804 166 $ 35.95 | ANC-4604804
Lid, 5" Round, 8 oz Plastic Clear
&9 (Lid Must Fit Bow! Above) SeueE ANGHEIR AT 381 $ 26.30 |ANC-LH4800D
189 Bowl, 5" Round Black 100z Plastic Bow! 500/CS ANCHOR 4604810 170 $ 36.95 | ANC-4604810
190 Lid, 5" Round, 1092 Plastic Clear (Lid 500/CS ANCHOR LH4800D 110
Must Fit Bowl Above) $  26.30 |ANC-LH4800D
191 Bowl, 6" Round Black 12 oz Plastic 500/CS ANCHOR 4605817 252 $ 40.15 | ANC-4605817
Lid, 6" Round, 12 oz Plastic Clear
ey (Lid Must Fit Bowl Above) s ANGHOIR LA 396 $ 35.90 [ANC-LH5800D
193 Bowl, 6" Black, 160z Plastic 500/CS ANCHOR 4605820 500 $ 43.15 | ANC-4605826
194 Lid, 6" Round, 16_02 Plastic Clear (Lid 500/CS ANCHOR L H5800D 200
Must Fit Bowl Above) $ 35.90 | ANC-LH5800D
195 Bowl, 7" Round, Black 200z Plastic 252/CS ANCHOR 4607221 0 $ 36.45 | ANC-4607221
196 Lid, 7" Round, 2092 Plastic Clear (Lid 252/CS ANCHOR LH7200 0
Must Fit Bowl Above) $ 34.30 |[ANC-LH7200
197 Bowl, 320z clear plastic 300/CS SAB-12032T 105 $ 53.50 | SAB-12032T300
198 Lid, Dome, Bowl 320z clear plastic 300/Cs SAB-52032T 105 $ 36.95 | SAB-52032T300
199 Bowl Black Plastic 24 oz. 250/CS Parpak 82638 42 $ 30.05 | PAR-82638
200 Lid, Bowl Black 24 oz. 250/Cs Parpak 82639 40 $ 32.95 | PAR-82639
201 Black Bowl w/ clear lid 18 oz. 150/CASE CUBEWARE CO-518 1 $ 25.25 |NPK-MNG168
Lot Total 2688
The following items #- will be awarded as
alot- LIDS MUST FIT BOWL/CUP
202 Container, Aluminum 1.5# Oblong 500/CS HFA 2016-30 125
203 Container Lid, Aluminum 1.5# Oblong 500/CS HFA 2062L 120
204 Container, 50z Styro Squat 1m/Cs Dart #5B20 84
205 Container Lid, Dome for 5 0z Styro Squat 1M/CS Dart #20HDLC 17
206 Container, 6 0z Styro Squat 1m/Cs Dart #6SJ12 266
207 Container Lid Vented for 6 oz Squat 1m/Cs Dart 12JL 276
208 Bowl, Styro, 10 oz Styro Squat 1M/CS Dart #10B20 563
209 Container, 12 0z Styro Squat 500/CS Dart #12SJ20 3
210 Container, 16 oz Styro Squat 1M/CS Dart #16MJ20 40
Container Lid, Vented for 10 0z bowl &
211 512,16 0z Squat 10/100/CS Dart 20JL 237
212 Container, Styro 40z 1M/CS (20/50) Dart #4J6 272
213 Container, Styro 60z 20/50/CS Dart #6J6 55
214 Lid, Clear Non Vened 10/100 DRT-20CLR 2
215 Container, 80z Styro Squat 1000/CS Dart #8SJ20 102
216 Container Lid, 8oz Styro Squat 1000/CS Dart #20JL 47
217 Cup, 80z Tumbler Clear Plastic 500/CS WNA - T8T 10
218 Cup, LID, 8oz. flat F/C 1M/CSs LLC-KL95PP 210
219 Cup, 8oz (Yogurt) 1000/CS LLC-KD8 50
220 Lid, 8oz Dome (Yogurt) 1000/CS LLC-HDL662NH 50
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221 Cup, 8oz Styro Coffee 1M/CS Dart 8J8 246
222 Cup Lid Vented 8 oz Styro Coffee 1000/CS Dart 8JL 81
223 Container, 8 oz Hngd Clear 200/cs GPK-ADO8 430
224 Cups, 10 oz Styro 1000/CS Dart 10312 50
225 Cup, 120z Styro (Hot) 1000/CS DART 12J12 106
226 Cup lid, slotted for 12 0z Styro 10/100/cs Dart #12SL 52
227 Cup, 14/16 oz Styro 20/50/CS Dart #14J16 59
228 Cup Lid, Slotted for 14/16 oz Styro 10/100/CS Dart #16SL 38
229 Cup, 24 oz Styro 500/CS Dart #24J16 10
230 Cup, 100z Translucent 1500/Cs SOLO - TP10D 5
231 Cup Lid, 100z Translucent 1000/CS SOLO - M6005 108
232 Cup Lid, Straw Slotted 1000/cs SOLO-662Ts 15
Lot Total 3729
The following items #will be awarded as a
lot
233 Cleaner, Ecolab Ultra Dry 4.5gal Ecolab #15172 10 99.72 |1/4.50al., Ecolab SUPC#5061247
234 Cleaner, Greasecutter Plus 4/1 Gal Eco Lab 19513 10 88,74 |4/1qal., Ecolab SUPC# 5883558
235 Cleaner, Lime Away 4/1 Gal Eco Lab 18700 14 42.73 |4/1al., Ecolab SUPCH# 3976277
236 Soap, Hand Antibacterial 6/750/ML Eco Lab 23672 3
78.29 |6/750ml, Ecolab SUPC#4294847
237 Soap Pantastic 5 Gal Eco Lab 12971 0 77.33 | 1/50al., Ecolab, SUPC# 5352265
239 Soap, Dishmachine Apex 4/6.375 Eco Lab 52 100.89 |4/6.75Ib., Ecolab, SUPC#0607182
240 Soap Machine Ultra Clean 5 Gal Eco Lab 12716 8 79.46 | 1/5qal., Ecolab, SUPC# 5309331
241 Soap, Tid Laundry Ultra HE 3/95 oz. #PG84997 0 20.83 |1/251b., Keystone, SUPC#8412142
242 Sanitizer, Machine Ecosan 4/1Gal Eco Lab 13979 0
47.58 |4/1gal., Ecolab, SUPC# 4214649
243 Sanitizer Oasis 146 Multi Quat 2.5 Gal Eco Lab 17708 342 83.85 |1/2.5qal., Ecolab, SUPC# 7006331
244 Cream Suds Pot & Pan Soap 25 |b/case P&G 84959162 0
77.33 |1/5qgal., Ecolab, SUPC# 5352265
245 Soap, Detergent Mac_hlne Warewashing 4i8# Eco-Lab #6110751 25
Solid 4/8lb., Ecolab, SUPC# 5426283
Lot Total 464
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot-LIDS MUST FIT BOWL IN THIS LOT
246 Container, 2 oz Plastic 2400/CS PACTIV YS200 470
247 Container Lid, for 2 oz Plastic 2400/CS PACTIV YLS2FR 456
248 Container, 4 oz Plastic 2400/CS PACTIV YS400 1292
249 Container Lid, for 4 oz Plastic 2400/CS PACTIV YLS3FR 1269
250 Container, 5.5 oz Plastic 10/250 PACTIV YS550 1098
251 Container Lid for 5.5 oz Plastic 2500/CS PACTIV YLS5FR 597
Lot Total 5182
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot - LIDS MUST FIT BOWL IN THIS LOT
252 Cup, Clear, Squat 12 /24 oz. im/CS VIGOUR VPTC-12 160 33.30 |EES-PTC14
253 Cup, 200z Salad Shaker - PRINTED 1000/CS VIGOUR 5C0020PR 10 54.00 |EES-PTC20-D98-STG
254 Cup Lid, Dome for 20 oz Salad Shaker 10/100/Cs VIGOUR VPTC-NH 90 19.40 | EES-D98NH
255 Cups, 20 oz Clear Soft, Salad Shaker 1000/CS VIGOUR VPTC20 302 42,50 |EES-PTC20
256 Cup Lid, Dome N Hole for 12-24 oz. 500/CS VIG-VPTC-NH 130 19.40 | EES-D98NH
Lot Total 692
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot LIDS MUST FIT BOWL IN THIS LOT
257 Lids, Parfait 12-24 0z No Hole Dome Lid 1000/CS LLC-KDL626NH 194
16.25 |LLC-KC626TS-NH
258 Cup, parfait insert, 4 0z 1000/Ccs SAB-14003D1000 247 21.40 |VIG-VPTC-ISTO8
259 Cup, Parfait Insert 5 oz 1000/CS GPK-1CH12-X 35 21.40 |VIG-VPTC-ISTO8
260 Cups, Parfait 12/ 14 oz. -must fit line 257 1000/CS VIGOUR VPTC-12 350 33.30 |EES-PTC14
261 Cups, Parfait 14 / 16 oz. -must fit line 257 1000/CS VIGOUR VPTC-16 65 35.35 | EES-PTC16
262 Lids, Parfait 14-16 oz 1000/CS LLC-KC626NH 127 16.25 |LLC-KCB26TS-NH
263 Parfait Kit, Cup/Insert/Lid 9 oz. 500/CS FAB-KC9T2CP 5

53.25

FAB-KC9T2CP
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Lot Total 1023
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
264 Cups, Soufflé 2 oz Paper 20/250/CS SOLO 200 1 36.85 |GPK-F200
265 Cups, Soufflé 3.25 oz Paper 20/250/CS GENPAK F325 20 49.40 | GPK-F325
266 Cups, Soufflé 4 oz Paper 20/250/CS GENPAK F400 10 57.25 |GPK-F400
267 Cup, paper, pleated, 3.5 0z 25/100 GPK-WA450F 60 40.75 | GPK-W450F
268 Cups, Souffle 5.5 oz Paper, Pleated 20/250/CS GENPAK F550 170 56.35 | GPK-F550
269 Cups, Styro 6 0z. 1000/CS Dart 6J6 75 15.45 | DRT-66
270 Lids, Cups 60z. Styro line # 241 1000/CS Dart 6JL 124 11.55 | DRT-6JL
Lot Total 460
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
271 Cutlery - Forks, Knives, or Spoons 1M/CS (COILIDINIAVK = ATz, A0k, 120
20671 10.05 |GOL-20651, GOL-20661, GOL-20671
272 Cutlery - Forks, Kni s mics NOEON, 70
utlery - Forks, Knives, or Spoons 6970.6971.6972 12.75 |[NTR-6880, NTR-6881, NTR-6882
Cutlery - Forks, Knives, or Spoons Med. NUTRIBON -
28 Weiaht Plastic 6" e 3640.3641.3642 696 5.05 |NTR-3640, NTR-3641, NTR-3642
274 Cutlery - Spoon, Soup Medium Weight 5000/CS NTR-3643 30 5.05 |NTR-3643
275 Utensil, Fork, HD Clear 1000/cs NTR-6870 565 12.75 |NTR-6870
276 Utensil, knives, HD Clear 1000/cs NTR-6871 100
12.75 [NTR-6871
277 Utensil, Spoon, HD Clear 1000/cs NTR-6872 460 1575 e
Lot Total 2041
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
278 Food Boat, Polycoated 1# 1000/CS GOLDEN WEST KB100 706
12.65 |CHI-FT100
279 Food Boat, Polycoated 1/4# 1000/CS SOUTHERN CHAMP 0560 300
10.95 |CHI-FT025
280 Food Boat, Polycoated 1/2# 1000/Cs SOUTHERN CHAMP 0562 216 12.15 | CHI-FT050
281 Food Boat, Polycoated 2# 1000/CS GOLDEN WEST KB200 636 13.95 |CHI-FT200
282 Food Boat, Polycoated 3# 500/CS GOLDEN WEST KB300 375 11.40 |GWP-KB300
Lot Total 2233
The following items #will be awarded as a
lot
283 Gloves, Disposable Plastic - Small 10/100/CS GOLDMAX 1503 196 3.45 |GOL-1503
284 Gloves, Disposable Plastic - Medium 10/100/CS GOLDMAX 1502 688 3.45 |GOL-1502
285 Gloves, Disposable Plastic - Large 10/100/Cs GOLDMAX 1501 235 3.45 |GOL-1501
286 Gloves, Latex, Powder Free - Small 10/100 cs GOLDMAX 7581 121 22.65 |GOL-7581
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free - Medium
287 10/100/CS GOLDMAX 7571 697 22.65 |GOL-7571
288 Gloves, Latex, Powder Free - Large 10/100/CS GOLDMAX 7561 768 22.65 |GOL-7561
289 Gloves, Latex, Powder Free - X-Large 10/100/CS GOLDMAX 7551 75 2265 |GOL-7551
. FOOD HANDLER FDH-104-
290 Gloves Plastic Textured Small 10/100 EHCT12 100 10.45 |GOL-1528
291 Gloves Plastic Textured Medium 10/100 (RO (RIANTDILIEIR (B0 120
FHCT14 10.45 |GOL-1527
292 Gloves Plastic Textured Large 10/100 (RO (RIANTDILIEIR (B0 30
FHCT16 10.45 |GOL-1526
293 GLOVES, POLY, EMBOSSED, SMALL 4/500/CS 104-502-CP 90 10.45 |GoL-1528
294 GLOVES, POLY, EMBOSSED, MEDIUM 4/500/CS 104-504-CP 50 2005 |eenmm
295 GLOVES, POLY, EMBOSSED, LARGE 4/500/CS 104-506-CP 5 w005 | e
296 Gloves, Rubber Blue - Small 12/PKG LIFEGUARD 4202 15 4.65 | NET-HHG7.0
297 Gloves, Rubber Blue - Medium 12/PKG LIFEGUARD 4203 95
4.65 |[NET-HHG8.0
298 Gloves, Rubber Blue - Large 12/PKG LIFEGUARD 4204 47
4.65 |NET-HHG9.0
299 Gloves, Rubber Blue - X-Large 12/PKG LIFEGUARD 7

4.6

a

NET-HHG10.0
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300

Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free, Small

10/100 CS

NET-754629

63

$ 18.25 |NET-754629
301 Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free, Medium 10/100 Cs NET-754629 211 $ 18.25 |NET-754631
302 Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free, Large 10/100 CS NET-754629 480 $ 18.25 |NET-754633
Lot Total 4093
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
303 Hairnet, Paper Boufant 10/100/BOX GOLDMAX 20251 151 $ 14.25 | GOL-20251
Hairnet, Cellucap Koronet, Polyester
& Honevcomb. - 20" Brown HoyoleE REAUANER 25 $ 51.50 |CEL-K220HNBR
305 Hairnet, String Assorted Colors 10/144/CS CELLUCAP HN100 43 q
81.50 | CEL-HN100BK CEL-HN100LB
Lot Total 219
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
306 Labels, Mandarin Orange Chicken 1000/roll EPS CQSP5353 100 a 500 | enepme
307 Labels, Teriyaki Chicken 1000/roll EPS CQSP5351 50 $ 6.40 |EPS-COSP-5351
Lot Total 150
The following items #will be awarded as a
lot
308 Mop Head - cotton EA ACS M8224 120
309 Mop Handles for above EA ACS M8901 27
Lot Total 147
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
310 Napkin & Straw "Wincup" #SK2NS 2000/CS Nuilber #58e 370 |g 1605 |NTR365S
311 Napkin, Fixfold 7" x 13.5" White 10000/CS GTS HS713 96 $ 19.25 |GTS-HS713
312 Napkin, Lowfold, 8.7" x 12" 24/334/CS NATIONAL 01255 225 s 10.65 |NAT-01255 32/250/CS
313 Napkins, Cocktail , White 4000/Cs NATIONAL HS99 15 $ 9.35 | NAT-HS99
314 Napkins, Dinner, white 2ply 1000/CS GLOBAL HS251 11 $ 26.25 | PRP-HS257 3000/CS
Lot Total 717
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
315 Pan Saver-Full Pan 6" deep 50/CS Pansaver 42002 1073
$ 25.40 |[PAN-42002
316 Pan Savers 34 X 12 4" deep 100/cs Pansaver 42001 231
$ 41.35 |PAN-42001
317 Pan Saver /Pan Liner, Bun Sheet 100/ cs Pansaver 42008 200 $ 23.25 |PAN-42008
Pan Liner, GPQ 16" x 24", PARCHMENT
318 PAPER 1000/CS Patterson 2405161 2619 s 25.45 |PAT-2405161-0000
319 Pan Liner, Silicone Treated 12" x 20" 2000/Cs Patterson 2557010-1220 0 $ 44.95 | PAT-2557010-1220 1000/CS
Lot Total 4123
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
320 Plastic Film 12" x 12" Perf. Heavy Cling Roll ANCHOR E151212 78 $ 10.35 | ANC-E151212
321 Plastic Film, 14" x 14" Perf. Heavy Cling Roll ANCHOR E151414 185 $ 10.90 | ANC-E151414
322 Plastic Film, 16" x 16" Perf. Heavy Cling Roll ANCHOR E151616 60 $ 12.65 | ANC-E151616
823 Plastic Film, 18" x 2000", 0.5 mil Roll ANCHOR CW182 262 $ 10.85 |RYN-914M
324 Plastic Wrap 12" x 2000 Roll Anchor NB122 10 $ 7.75 |RYN-910M
325 Plastic Wrap 24" x 2000 Roll Anchor NB242 70 $ 15.15 |RYN-916M
Lot Total 665
The following items # will be awarded as a
lot
326 Plate, 6" Café Black 1000/CS CHI-01371 20 $ 39.90 |GPK-BLKO6
327 Plate. 9" Café Black 400/CS CHI-01369 28 $ 40.90 |GPK-BLK09
330 Plate, 6" Paper, Heavy 1000/CS JRV-SX6PATH 23 $ 28.45 |JRV-SXP6PATH
331 Plate. 9" Paper. Heavv 1000/CS JRV-UX9PATH 93 $ 58.40 |JRV-UX9PATH
332 Plate, 6" Styro, White 1000/CS DART 6PWC 40 $ 11.45 |DRT-6PWC
333 Plate, 9" Styro. White 500/CS DART 9PWC 70 $ 11.25 |DRT-9PWC
334 Plate, Oval, 10.125" 500/cs JRV-SXP10PATH 25 $ 54.45 |JRV-SXP10PATH
335 Bagasse Plate 9' 4/125/cs PRM-PL-09 15 $ 26.80 |PRM-PL-09
336 Plates, paper 9" budget 1200/cs Nature Own 20 $ 19.25 |AJM-PP9GRAWH
Lot Total 334
The following items # will be awarded as a
337 Test Strips Quat Refill, 120+ Tests 2 rolls/box LUSEUX QT-10 0 $ 4.95 |LUS-OT-10
338 Test Strips Chlorine Refill, 200+ Tests 2 rolls/box LUSEUX CM-240 85 s 4.75 |LUS-CM-240
Lot Total 85
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The following item #will be awarded as a
lot

339 Trash Can Liners 40 x 48 Black 22MIC 150/CS FORTUNE BCRHD4048XH 900
340 Trash Can Liners 37x50 44 gal Blk .9 mil 5/20cs 16

Lot Total 916

The following items # will be awarded as a
lot

341 Tray, 12" Black Platter 50/CS PARPAK 51200 1 17.25 |PAR-51200
342 Lid for 12" Tray, Clear Dome 50/CS PARPAK 51230 10 1645 |Pemszm
343 Tray, 16" Black Platter 50/CS PARPAK 51600 10 38.15 |PAR-51600
344 Lid for 16" Tray, Clear Dome 50/CS PARPAK 51627 10 37.25 |PAR-51627

Lot Total 31

The following itemsl# will be awarded as a
ot

345 SALAD/#CAKE TRAY CLEAR Form P'asfsclmo 5032 16 e | e
346 SALAD/PASTRY TRAY CLEAR Form PIaS'ligHOO 092 g 131.00 |FRM-5042-151700
347 SALAD/BUN TRAY CLEAR Form PIaStlisﬂoo R 133.00 |FRM-5052-171700
348 1 CMPT DUAL OVEN TRAY Form Plasﬂg4539 5057- 10 168.00 |FRM-5057-404539
349 1 CMPT DUAL OVEN TRAY Form Plasﬂg 4539 i 137.00 |FRM-5037-404539
350 2 CMPT LRG BURGER TRY Form Plasﬂg4539 S 202.00 |FRM-6278-404539
351 93/8” X 2000' DUL OVEN PERF' Form Plaste e | 4 245.00 | FRM-9773-2000DPPCP
352 93/8" X 5100' 985CV RL/CS e Plasslti)CODPsasscv T 0 420.00 |FRM-0773-5100DP985CV
353 93/8” X 5100' DUL OVENABLE 1 Form Plaste e |6 512.00 |FRM-9773-5100DPCP
354 10 3/8" X 5100' DUAL OVENABLE Form Plaste opcp 0| 4 422.00 |FRM-9785-5100DPCP

Lot Total 386
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